City Of Meriden
Bid Tabulation Sheet

Project #: B024-34 - Janitorial & Paper Products for Meriden Public Schools

Department: Meriden Public Schools/BOE

Bid Opening Date: December 20, 2023

Bid Opening Time: 11:00 AM

Section 1 Section 1 Section 1 Section 1 Section 1 Section 2 Section 2
Item #1 Von Item #2 Von Item #5 Facial | Item #6 Gabage [ Item #7 Garbage
Drehle #PR470| Drehle #863B Item #3 Von | Item #4 Von Drehle | Tissue Marcal [Liners Black Low| Liners, Natural
2-Ply Porta- White Drehle #3275 Model #8838 Pro 2930 - 500| Density Can | Clear High Density
Vendor Roll White [ Hardwound Roll |Toilet Paper Mini- Mechanical Cases Liners -60 Gal. - |Can Liners - 15 Gal.
Toilet Tissue - | Towels - 950 | Twin Dispenser - | Compact Dispensers 2,000 Cases - 1,500 Cases
975 Cases at 24| Cases at 12 Rolls| 950 Cases at 12 - 950 Cases at 12
Rolls per Case per Case Rolls per Case Rolls per Case
Agni Enterprises $168.27 $97.10 $90.70 $98.58 No bid No bid No bid
40 x 60
Geriatric Medical No bid No bid No bid No bid $15.99 $35.99 $13.99
$139.60 @ 4
Next Gen $47.16 S44.41 $79.56 @ 4 $53.18 $23.75 $29.25 $17.48
Dumouchel Paper Co. No bid No bid No bid No bid $16.95 $29.98 19.81 Alt $25.60
AASDEL No bid S24.75 No bid No bid $35.00 $26.50 $18.75
WB Mason $44.50 $45.99 No Charge $45.99 $16.99 $26.74 $22.15
United Sales $38.50 $54.95 No Charge No bid $12.19 $19.82 $11.92
Imperial Bag Paper $39.05 $46.48 $37.83 $63.94 $17.74 $29.48 $24.73




Safety & Occupational No bid No bid No Bid No bid $46.15 $27.09 $30.09
Carey Wiper & Supply $44.90 $44.80 $25.00 $50.00 $22.25 $29.70 $18.20
ABCO $46.50 $47.95 No bid No bid No bid $24.50 $22.50
UNIPAC No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid $21.75 $12.75
Interboro Packaging No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid $20.68 $14.92
Central Polybag No bid $40.26 No bid No bid $19.48 $18.05 $13.80
Mansfield Paper Co. $44.63 $43.63 $78.46 $52.45 $22.62 $25.67 $21.63
K & S Distributors $45.60 $45.49 $14.96 $40.00 $22.95 $28.50 $35.79
Suburban No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid $23.80 $18.20
Quantum Capital $78.24 $71.19 $36.00 $115.00 $39.24 $60.27 $50.48




